
HEALTH AND WELLBEING BOARD 

10 March 2020 

Title:   
 
NHS Long Term Plan – Response of the ELHCP – Strategic Delivering Plan 

Open Report For Information  

Wards Affected: ALL Key Decision: No 

Report Authors: 
Mark Scott, Deputy Director of 
Transformation 

Contact Details:  

ELHCP PMO office, 2nd Floor, Unex Tower, 

5 Station Street, London E15 1DA  

020 3688 2300  

enquiries@eastlondonhcp.nhs.uk 

Sponsor: Not applicable 
Summary 

In January 2019, NHS England published it’s Long Term Plan (LTP). It set out the NHS’ 
ambitions for improvement over the next decade. Patients and their families, NHS staff, the 
public and a wide range of organisations were involved in developing the plan. There are a 
number of priority areas of work ranging from mental health to focussing on key enabler 
areas such as workforce.   

The East London Health and Care Partnership (ELHCP) have been working with partners 
(CCG’s, providers and local authorities) to develop a local response to the LTP, which sets 
out how the Partnership will work together to respond to known challenges and deliver 
improvements to health and care services.  

An update on the development of the response was first presented to the Board in 
September 2019.  The System Operating Plan, published in April 2019, forms the first year 
of this plan. The final draft of our ‘local LTP response’, also known as the strategy delivery 
plan, (SDP) was submitted to NHS England/Improvement in November 2019. The intention 
is that the detail of the SDP will form the basis of engagement and discussions at both 
Health and Wellbeing Boards and Overview and Scrutiny meetings. The SDP has now been 
published on the ELHCP website:   https://www.eastlondonhcp.nhs.uk/ourplans/  

Given the focus of January Board’s meeting we presented those aspects of the SDP which 
addressed the health needs of children. This presentation and discussions will centre on the 
remaining sections of the Plan.        

Recommendations 
 
The Health and Wellbeing Board is asked to: 
 
1. Note the report and presentation on the Strategic Delivery Plan and  

 
2. Provide any feedback and comments. 
 
 
 
 

Reasons 
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The National Long-Term Plan was released in early 2019. It sets out how to make the NHS 
fit for the future, delivering a range of benefits as set out below: 
 
By giving everyone the best start in life through better maternity services, including a 
dedicated midwife looking after a mother throughout her pregnancy, by joining up services 
from birth through to age 25, particularly improving care for children with long term 
conditions like asthma, epilepsy and diabetes and revolutionizing how the NHS cares for 
children and young people with poor mental health with more services in schools and 
colleges. 
 
By delivering world-class care for major health problems to help people live well with faster 
and better diagnosis, treatment and care for the most common killers, including cancer, 
heart disease, stroke and lung disease, achieving survival rates that are among the best in 
the world, supporting families and individuals with mental health problems, making it easier 
to access talking therapies and transforming how the NHS responds to people experiencing 
a mental health crisis.  
 
By helping people age well with fast and appropriate care in the community, including in 
care homes, to prevent avoidable hospital admissions for frail and older people, and by 
significantly increasing the numbers of people who can take control of their healthcare 
through personal budgets.  
 

 
 


